
Will County Public Health & Public Safety Committee
23-90

17.2

RESOLUTION OF THE COUNTY BOARD

WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

Renewing Contracts for Dietary & Nursing Products for Sunny Hill Nursing Home

WPIEREAS, the current contracts for dietary & nursing products for Sunny Hill Nursing

Home expire on April 30, 2023, and

WHEREAS, the current contracts allow for the extension of said contracts at one year

intervals, if the County so chooses, and

Nursing Home Administrator has recommended, and theWHEREAS, the Sunny Hi

Public Health & Safety Committee has concurred, that the contracts with Medline Industries,

Northfield, IL and Dispose N Save, Monroe, NY, for dietary & nursing products for Sunny Hill

Nursing Home be renewed for one year from May 1, 2023, through and including April 30,

2024, pursuant to the terms and specifications on the original Bid Tab Sheet, and

WHEREAS, sufficient appropriations have been budgeted for this purpose, and

WHEREAS, the Public Health & Public Safety Committee concurs with this

recommendation,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Will County Board hereby authorizes the

County Executive to renew the contracts with Medline Industries, Northfield, IL and Dispose N

Save, Monroe, NY, for dietary & nursing products for Sunny Hill Nursing Home for one year

from May 1, 2023, through and including April 30, 2024, pursuant to the terms and

specifications on the original Bid Tab Sheet.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Preamble of this Resolution is hereby adopted as if

fully set herein. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect upon its passage and approval as

provided by law.



17.2Will County Board 23-90 Meeting of March 16, 2023

Adopted by the Will County Board this I6th day of March, 2023,

AYES: Deane-Schlottman, VanDuyne, Ogalla. Pretzel. Butler. Newquist, Balich, Richmond, Parker,
Williams, Diaz, Coleman, Logan, Freeman, Revis, Mitchell, Ortiz. Berkowicz, Mueller, Costa,
Traynere
WinfreyAWAY:

Result: Approved - (Unanimous)

III County

Approved this day of. 2023.



17.2.a

JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRANT
WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE1%

WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS%
I

KEVIN LYNN
DIRECTORPURCHASING DEPARTMENT

County Office Building
302 N. Chicago Street

Joliet. IL 60432

P 816>740'4712
F 815-740-4604

E klynn@willcountyillinois.com

$

February 3, 2023 c
<u
a:
■a

Dispose N'Save
S Getzil Berger Blvd,
Monroe, NY 10950

m
V)
u
3

■o
o

Q.
Via email: abraham@diSDosensave.com O)

c
12

BID tt 2022-29 Dietary and Nursing Supplies
Sunny Hili Nursing Home

3RE:
od

ffi
0)Dear Mr. Jeremias, Q

o
The contract for Dietary and Nursing supplies for Will County Sunny Hill Nursing Home will
expire on April 30, 2023, We are in the position to exercise the optional 2"'^ year renewal as
stated In the original bid. The new contract period will be effective May 1, 2023 through April
30, 2024.

Oi
fO
CN

(0oo
Q
ni
$

The yearly contract amount will not increase as stated in the contract. Please contact me in
writing, via email within ten (10) days as it requires County Board approval.

c
o
q:
(Q
0)
>-We look forward to another year of a very efficient and sound working relationship, if you have

any questions, please call me anytime at (815) 740-4712.
TJ
c
o
o
0)
(0

c
Sincerely, <u

E
o
<Q

<

Purcha^ Director

CC: Maggie McDowell , 5HNH Administrator



17.2.a

JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRANT
WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE

WILL COUNTY, ILLINOISs

i\
KEVIN LYNN

DIRECTORPURCHASING DEPARTMENT

County Office Building
302 N Chicago Street

Joliet. IL 60432

P 815-740^712
F, 815-740-4604
E. klynn@wiilcoumyillinois.com

CQ

$
o

February 3, 2023 c
0)
ce
■a

Medline Industries
Three Lakes Dr.
NorthfieldJL 60093

CD
(0
u
3

●o
o
0.
O)

Via email: povbids@medline.com c
V)
zs

BID # 2022-29 Dietary and Nursing Supplies
Sunny Hill Nursing Home

RE; o6

(Q
O
aDear Mr. Bae,
oo>

The contract for Dietary and Nursing supplies for Will County Sunny Hill Nursing Home will
expire on April 30, 2023. We are in the position to exercise the optional 2"'’ year renewal as
stated in the original bid. The new contract period will be effective May 1, 2023 through April
30, 2024,

The yearly contract amount will increase by 15% as stated in the contract. Please contact me in
writing, via email within ten (10) days as it requires County Board approval.

We look forward to another year of a very efficient and sound working relationship. If you have
any questions, please call me anytime at (815) 740-4712.

CO
CN

l/>
U
o
Q
(9

V
c
Q>q:
(Q
0>>●

TJ
Cou
<u

CO

c
0>
E

Sincerely, un
<

K^n wnn
Purcha\l^ Director

CC: Maggie McDowell , SHNH Administrator



17.2.aPrice/ CPSLPrice/ ??Price/ CPSLPrice/??UOM Pack SizeYrQtylitem Description
PK18050 DISPENSE EXPRESS NAPKINS

No BidIncorrect item BidIncorrect item500/12WHITE

76.97 No BidS$  10,313.98134 CS 3651 PLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 50Z

CQ

$No Bid66.96CS $  4,486.32 $6752 PLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 90Z 36 0)
c
a>
(TNo Bid88.06SCS $ 5,900.026753 PLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 120Z 36
■o

m
SL96PLASTIC COFFEE MUG

WHITE/SILVER 80Z
54 U)

No Bid oNo Bid8/24 3
●o
o

PK80 CLPLASTIC DINNER PU\TE
WHITE/SILVER 9”

55
3)No BidNo Bid12/10 c

3
PK100PLASTIC PLATE WHITE/SILVER 6”56 o6No BidNo Bid15/10

n>
0)

PK100PLASTIC BOWL WHITE/SILVER
10OZ

57 Q
No BidNo Bid15/10 o

O)
fO
<MSL96PLASTIC COFFEE MUG

IVORY/GOLD 80Z
58

No BidNo Bid v>8/24 uo
Q

CS159 PLASTIC DINNER PLATE
IVORY/GOLD 9"

(Q
$No BidS  166.14$ 166.141000 <u
c
0)
a:

No BidCS $  117.712 S 235.4260 PLASTIC PLATE IVORY/GOLD 6’ 1000 m
(U
>-
TDPK100PLASTIC BOWL IVORY/GOLD 10OZ61 c
oNo BidNo Bid15/10 u
o

c/>

CS262 PLASTIC FORKS REFLECTIONS
SILVER/ BLACK 7 72”

c
o

No Bid12.30$ 24.60 $1000 E
sz
o
(C
t3CSPLASTIC SPOONS REFLECTIONS

SILVER/ BLACK 7 Va"
363 <

No Bid20/24 (480) No Bid

Dispose N SaveMedline



Item Description YfOty UOM Pack Size Price/ ?? Price/ CPSL Price/?? 17.2.aPrice/ CPSL

35 PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICK’S 1 cs
200ea/cs No Bid No Bid

36PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER CS1
CO200ea/cs No Bid No Bid $
o
c
0)

37 PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER’S DAY CS1 a:
T3200ea/cs No Bid No Bid m

(0
38 PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN CS1 o

3
200ea/cs No Bid No Bid ●ao

Q.

39 PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING 1 CS O)
c

200ea/cs No Bid No Bid
3

40 PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR CS 001 200ea/cs No Bid No Bid
re

41 PLACEMAT BLUE GREEK KEY 200 CS 1000 0)No Bid No Bid Q

o42 WIPES FOODSERVICE. PINK
STRIPE

190 CS O)
CO200 No Bid No Bid <M

t/i
U

43 TOWELETTE WET NAP 20 CS 1000 $ o596.40 $ 29.82 No Bid Q
re

44 BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE, 1
GALLON

6 CS 0)
c1000 $ 321.54 $ 53.59 No Bid

O'

re
45 CAMBRO LID MUG 80Z. 9 SL 1500 $ 0)525.87 $ 58.43 No Bid

>“

TJ
C

46 CAMBRO LID BOWL 90Z. 25 SL 1000 $  1,447.00 o$ 57.88 No Bid u
Ol

CO
47 VINYL GLOVES LARGE 250 BX 100/10 No Bid $ 975.00 3,90 c

0)
E

48 VINYL GLOVES MEDIUM 350 BX 100/10 £No Bid 1,365.00 $ 3.90 o
re
C
<49 VINYL GLOVES X-LARGE 250 BX 100/10 $No Bid 975.00 $ 3.90

Medline Dispose N Save



17.2.aPrice/ CPSLPncel'?’?Price/ CPSLPrice/ ??Pack Si^YrQty UOMItem Descnption

240 PKBEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER
GREEN

18
No BidNo Bid5D/12

No BidPK 50/12 No Bid12019 BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED R)
5
0}
cNo BidPK 50/12120 No Bid20 BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE o
q:
TO

No BidPK 50/12120 No Bid21 BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY CD

U120 PKBEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC
WHITE

22 3
■DNo BidNo Bid50/12 o
Q.
O)

BGBOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE 10023 c
(ANo BidNo Bid100/10 3

s 208.20 S 20.82$  4,594.00OS S  45.940.0010BUN RACK COVER 52” X 80’ 50/1024
(0

No BidPK 50/121,800 No Bid25 DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE Q

o
CT)120 PK26 DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN <o

No Bid50/12 No Bid
(A
U
ONo BidPK 50/1227 DINNER NAPKINS YELLOW 1,200 No Bid Q
(Q
$

No BidPK 50/12120 No Bid28 DINNER NAPKINS RED 0)
c
O'

PK 50/12 No Bid600 No Bid29 DINNER NAPKINS ECRU m
0)>-

■DNo Bid140 PK 100/2830 DINNER NAPKINS WHITE No Bid c
ou
o

CS 1000 51.00 No BidPLACEMAT GOOD MORNING 60 $  3.060.00 s c/331
c
o

2 CSPLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY
BIRTHDAY

E32
No BidNo Bid200ea/cs o

re
c
<

CS No BidPLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC 3 200ea/cs No Bid33

No BidCS 200ea/csPLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE 1 No Bid34

Dispose N SaveMedline



I 17.2.aMedline Dispose N Save
item Description Yr Qty UOM Pack Size Price/ ?? Price/ CPSL Price/?? Price/ CPSL

1 STYROFOAM CUPS 16 OZ 312 CS 500 S  13,047-84 5 41.82 No Bid

2 STYROFOAM CUP UDS 156 CS 1000 $  6,857.76 S 43.96 No Bid

3 STYROFOAM CUPS BOZ CB32 CSi1'DG0 5 1,074.88 S 33.59 No Bid 5
c
a>

4 STYROFOAM CUP UDS BOZ. 12 CS 1000 $ a.563.88 S 46.99 No Bid
■o
m

5 STYROFOAM SQUAT CUPS 402 12 CS 1000 s 487.44 S 40.62 No Bid (A
U
3

6 STYROFOAM SQUAT CUP UDS 40Z 50 SL ■o
o

100/10 No Bid No Bid a.
a>
c

7 CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE 250 CTN 4 S 100.68 126 0.40 No Bid
3
z

8 DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT 00170; CS 1000 S 2,963.10 $ 17.43 No Bid
nj

9 CLEAR DRINKWARE 1002 0)36 SL 100/6 No Bid No Bid a
o10 DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 802 CS o>

3 1000 $ 268.17 $ 89.39 CMNo Bid
(A
CJ

11 DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS 10 CS o
Q

10000 $ 558.00 $ 55.80 No Bid n>
0)
c12 DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 16 BALE 500 $ 407.36 $ 25.46 No Bid 0)
q:
n

13 DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4 48 BALE 500 0)$ 850.56 $ 17.72 No Bid >-
TJ
C

14 DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG 12 BX 1000 o$ $435.12 $ 36.26 154.08 $ 12.84 u
0)

CO

DISPOSABLE APRONS MEDWT15 10 CS 500 $ 703.80 $ 70.38 No Bid c
0>
E

16 FOIL ROLL W/CUTTER BOX
18''X1000’

.c15 RL o
(D

1 $ 869.85 $ ts57.99 No Bid <

17 FILM WRAP W/CUTTER BOX
18”X1000'

80 BX
1 No Bid No Bid

Medline Dispose N Save



17.2.aBID TABULATION SHEET

22-29 SHNH, Dietary & Nursing Supplies
OPENED: 2-18-22, 10:05 A.M.

DEPARTMENT:

DUE: 2-18-22, 10:00 A.M.

TOTAL COST-1 YEARREQUIREMENTSBIDDER

BID BOND;

PRIME CERT; Y N

SAMPLES; Y N

FORM SIGNED; Y N

COMPLETE BID; Y N

$ No Bid
Warehouse Direct

Yr 2 %

Des Plaines, IL Yr 3 %
(0

5% of disc
0>
c
a>

LEAD
■D

CD
$  7
Yr2% --er

BID BOND;

PRIME CERT: N

SAMPLES: N

FORM SIGNED; (J) N
COMPLETE BID: Y N

V)

Dispose N Save u
3

T3
O

a.Yr 3 %
Monroe, NY O)

c
% of disc VI

3

LEAD ofi
S'

lU- (QBID BOND:

PRIME CERT^(2?
SAMPLES:

FORMSIGNE'D: Q)
COMPLETE BID;

N

Y

Yr2% - I5%
Yr 3 %

% of disc " ^

0)

DNMedline Industries o
(7)
CO
cs

NNorthfleld, IL V)(.)
 N o

Q
reLEAD 5
0
C
0BID BOND:

PRIME CERT; Y N

SAMPLES: Y N

FORM SIGNED: Y N

COMPLETE BID: Y N

$ a:
re
0

Yr 2 % >
T3
C

Yr 3 % o
o
0

% of disc
c
0
£LEAD
u
re

BID BOND:

PRIME CERT: Y N

SAMPLES: Y N

FORM SIGNED; Y N

COMPLETE BID: Y N

$ <

Yr 2 %

Yr 3 %

% of disc

LEAD

ttiger, Eddie B^dley
—■ 7''^ .

ALSO PRESENT: KcviPl Lynn



17.2.a

JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRANT
WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVEWILL COUNTY, ILLINOISV%

V%% i» KEVIN LYNN
DIRECTOR1

P 015^740-4712
F 815-740-4604

E, klynn(§willcouniyillinois,com

County Office Building
302 N. Chicago Street

Joliet, IL 60432

ITEM: 2022-29 Dietary & Nursing Supplies Bid (0
5

DEPARTMENT: Sunny Hill Nursing Home of Will County
c
Q>

u:
■D

CQ
I

U)
BID RELEASED: February 3, 2022 u

3
T3
O

PUBLISHED NOTICE: Herald News & Demand Star Internet Q.
cn
c

FUNDING SOURCE: Sunny Hill Nursing Home of Will County Budget 3

BID OPENING: o6February 17, 2022,10:05 A.M.
re

LOCATION: Will County Office Building
302 N. Chicago Street
Joliet, III. 60432

0)
o
o
at
r>

V)
uBIDDING RESULTS: o
Q
re

0)NUMBER RELEASED: 19 +INTERNET cNUMBER RETURNED: 2 re
OC

re
re

>●BIDDER: TOTAL PRICE ●o
c
o

See attached spreadsheets for comparison pricing and recommendation letter for product seiections.

Recommendation from Maggie McDowell. SHNH Administrator, is to split the award of this bid
to two (2) bidders, for an approximate first year annual cost of $61,553.76, as stipulated in the
bid document; Medline industries, Northfield, IL, for an approximate cost of $56,897.58, and
Dispose N Save, Monroe, NY, for an approximate cost of $4,656.18.

The contract begins May 1, 2022 through April 30, 2023, with two (2) additional one (1) year renewal
options, at the discretion of Will County. These costs are approximate, based on resident population and
needs and includes consideration of 2'’“ and 3'** year increase in pricing, as allowed in the bid document.

u
re

CO

c
re
E
.c
u
re
ts
<



17.2.aPrice/ CPSLPrice/ CPSL Price/ ??Price/ ??Pack SizeYr Qty UOMUem Description
CSPLASTIC KNIVES REFLECTIONS 364

No BidSILVER/ BLACK 7 No Bid20/24 (480)

CSPLASTIC FORKS REFLECTIONS

SILVER/ WHITE 7

3;65
No Bid20/24 (480) No Bid

tQ

5
0)

CS EPLASTIC SPOONS REFLECTIONS

SILVER/ WHITE 7 y/

366 .Q)
a.
■o

No Bid20/24 <480) No Bid m
(A

2 CS: uPLASTIC KNIVES REFLECTIONS
SILVER/WHITE 7

67 3
●D12.92 No Bid25.84 S1000 $ o
Q.
o:No Bid$83.07 $ 83.07CS 300050Z PAPER DRINKING CUPS 168 c
U)

3No Bid$302 70 $ 30.27CS 5003 COMP FOAM DINNER PLATE 9' 1069 z
od

No BidCS 4/125 No BidSTYROFOAM DINNER PLATE 9‘ 10070
CO
a>

No Bid$655.36 $ 40.96CS 1000STYROFOAM CAKE PLATE 6" 16 o71
o
9>$  4,656.18$  103,272.70Grand Total 1st Year fO

$  4,888.99$  103,272.70 CN2nd Year w/% Inc
$  5,133.44$  103,272.703rd Year w/% Inc (Auo

O0.00%15%Optional Year two (2) Percentage Increase CO0.00%15%Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase
0)0.00%0%Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its entirety E
0)Lead 2 days2 dayslead a:
CO
0)>-

■Oc
ou
0)
V)

c
0)
E
£
O
CO
ts
<



I
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Attachment: Second Year Renewal Docs (23-90 : Dietary & Nursing Products - Bid Renewal)



17.2.a

Sunny ILL JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRAN*

WILLCOUNTYEXECUTIV

1NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY
i MARGARET MCDOWELL. LNHA, Rr

ADMINISTRATOF

P.(815)727=8710

F.(815)727-8637

W. willcountyilllnois.com/aunnyhill

Sunny Hill Nursing Hom«
421 Doris Avenue

Joliet, IL6043:

re
$o
c
0)
CC
●o

3/23/2022 CD

12o
Will County Board Members,

Regarding RFP #2022-29 Nursing/Diciary products for Sunny Hill Nursing of Will County:

Predominantly, there exists only ONE bid with a SECOND bid for a select number of products (2), submitted
received, and accepted by the Will County Purchasing Department for services that w'ill provide Sunny Hill

Nursing home with Nursing/ Dietary products due to a bid renewal process and current contract expiration.

Based on a very limited selection option and elevated prices as compared to former bids, selections are as
follows:

3
T3
O
Q.

c

3

o6
S're
o
Q
oo>
fO
CMDISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG - Year Ouantitv/12 - UOM/BX - Pack Size- 1000
tf)uoBY: 1 . Medline-$36.26 -$435.12 Q
re
5

2. Dispose N Save - $ 12.84 - $ 154.08

Therefore, I am recommending that the Nursing/Dietary product - DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG be

awarded to Dispose N Save in the amount of $36.26  = $435.12 with an optional Year Two (2) percentage
increase of0% and an optional Year Three (3) percentage increase of 0%. Lead time ARO is 2 days.

0)co
q:
reo
>-
TJ
C
ouo
(A
coYear Ouantitv/50 - UOM/EA - Pack Size - 1RUN RACK COVER 52” X 80 E
ureBY: l.Medline-$9l .89-$918.80 c
<

2. Dispo.se N Save - $20.82 - $208.20

Therefore, 1 am recommending that the Nursing/Dictary product - RUN RACK COVER 52” X 80” be
awarded to Dispose N Save in the amount of $20.82  = $208.20 with an optional Year Two (2) percentage
increase or0% and an optional Year Three (3) percentage increase of 0%. I.ead time ARO is 2 days.

THE LEADER IN RESIDENT CENTERED CARE AND ACTIVE LIVING"
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SuNNY^ -Hill JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRAN'

WILLCOUNTYEXECUTIV

1NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY

MARGARET MCDOWELL, LNHA, Rr
ADMINlSTRATOf

P.(815)727-8710

F,(815)727-8637

W, willcountyilllnois.com/sunnyhill

Sunny Hill Nursing Homt

421 Doris Avenue ro

Joliet,IL6043: Ic
0)
CH
●a

i am recommending that the tollowing Nursing/Dielary product provisions be awarded to Medline as there an ^
NO nil) alternate contenders received. (A

O
Z3

■aSTYROFOAM CUPS I6 0Z CS o
312 500 S13.047.84 $41.82 0.

O)
c

STYROFOAM CUP LIDS CS v>
156 31000 $6,857.761 $4.3.96

o6
STYROFOAM CUPS 80Z CS S'

32 1000 $1,074.88i $33.59 m
o>
QSTYROFOAM CUP LIDS 80Z. CS

12 o1000 $563.88 $46.99 o>
fO
CN

STYROFOAM SQUAT CUPS 40Z 12 CS
lA1000 $487.44 $40.62 o
o
Q

CUTI.ERY SETS DISPOSABLE CTN re
250 4 $100.68 $0.40 0)

c
0>

DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT aCS
170 1000 $2.963.10 $17,43 rea>

>
DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 80Z T3CS c

o3 1000 $268.17 $89.39 ure
<0

DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS 10 CS
c10000 $558.00 $55.80 re
E

DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG «8 u16 BALE re
500 $407.36 $25.46 <

DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG «4 48 BALE
500 $850.56 $17.72

DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT 10 CS
500 $703.80 $70.38

FOIL ROI.L W/CUrn-R BOX
IS’XIOQO'

15 RL
$869.85 $57.99

THE LEADER IN RESIDENT CENTERED CARE AND ACTIVE LIVING"



17.2.a

Sunny ILL JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRAN'

WILLCOUNTYEXECUTIV

NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY
i MARGARET MCDOWELL. LNHA, Rt

ADMINISTRATOF

Sunny Hill Nursing Homt

42 i Doris Avenue «

Joliet,IL6043; ^

P.(815)727'8710

F.(815)727-8637

W willcountylllinois.com/sunnyhill
9i

●o
mcs20TOWElXiTl'E WET NAP

S29.82S596.401000 tf)
u
3

T3CS6BAG POLY. RECLOSEABLE, 1
GALLON

o
$53.59$321.541000 Cl

O)
c

SL9CAMBRO L!D MUG 807:. VI
$58.43$525.871500 3

z
o6

SL25CAMBRO LID BOWL 90Z.
$57.881000 $1,447.00 re

(1)
Q

BX250VINYL GLOVES LARGE
$3.90 o$975.00100/10 o>

<o
CM

BX350VINYL GLOVES MEDIUM
V)$3.90$1.365.00100/10 u
o
Q

BX250VINYL GLOVES X-LARGE, re
$3.90$975.00100/10 o>

c
o

cc.cs134PLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 50Z
$76.97$10,313.98I36 re

>●
T3

CSPLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 90Z 67 c
o$4,486.32 $66.9636 ure
Vi

csPLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 120Z 67 c
$88.06$5.900.0236 re

E
£
o

CSPl.ASTIC DINNER PLATE-
IVORY/GOLD 9"

re
ti
<I

$166.14$166.141000

CS■)PLASTIC DINNER PLATE-
IVORY/GQLD6" $235.42 $117.71I  1000

cs2PLASTIC PORKS REPLECTIONS
SILVER/BLACK 7 '/: M $12.30$24.601000

THE LEADER IN RESIDENT CENTERED CARE AND ACTIVE LIVING
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ILL JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRAN*

WILLCOUNTYEXECUTIV

NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY

MARGARET MCDOWELL, LNHA, Rf
ADMINISTRATOF

P.(8Ii)72?'87lO

F,(815)717=8637

W. willcountyillinois,com/8unnyhill

Sunny Hill Nursing Hom«

421 Doris Avenue ro

Joliet, IL6043.' ic

Qt
■D

m
PLASTIC KNIVES REFLECTIONS
SILVER/WHITE? '/j”

I2 CS V)
o1000 $25.84 SI 2.92 3

●o
o

50Z PAPER DRINKING CUPS CS Q.
3000 S83.07 □)S83.07 c

i/>

3 COMP FOAM DINNER PLATE 9' 10 CS 500 $302.70 $30.27 3

o6
STYROFOAM CAKE PLATE 6 16 CS cT

re1000 $655.36 $40.96 re
Q

om

Thurgl'orc. overtill. I am recommending that the Nursing/Dietary  bids be awarded as outlined which reflect

necessary and required supplies for our Sunny Hill residents. There is an optional Year Two (2) percentage
increase of i 5% and an optional Year Three (3) percentage increase of 15%. Lead time ARO is 2 days.

CN

cnu
o
Q
re
re
c

Sincerely
I re

O'

re
re

Maggie McDow'ell. LNHA, RN
Administrator

>-
●a
c
o
ore

CO

c
re
E
.c
o
re
<

THE LEADER !N RESIDENT CENTERED CARE AND ACTIVE LIVING”


