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PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 

2025-28 Housekeeping Supplies 

Addendum #1 – March 7, 2025 

We received multiple requests for previous bid pricing, please 
see attached spreadsheet with 2022 awarded pricing noted. 

We received the following questions regarding this RFQ: 

Question #1: Item #6: The specified size is 30"x47" 20 gallon. A typical 20-gallon can liner 
usually measures 30"x37" or 30"x36". Please clarify if the specified size is a typo, or you indeed 
require a 30"x47" liner. 

Answer #1: The size requirements listed are correct, please bid as the form shows. 

Question #2: Item #7: The specified case pack is 1,000 bags/case. A typical 30"x37" can liner 
usually comes packaged with maximum 500 bags/case. Please clarify if the specified count is a 
typo, or you indeed require the price per 1000 bags in a case.   

Answer #2: We will accept 500 per case, please ensure you are bidding on the correct total 
quantity. 

Question #3: The specified case pack is 250 bags/case. A typical 38"x60" can liner usually comes 
packaged with a maximum of 200 bags/case. Please clarify if the specified count is a typo or if 
you indeed require the price per 250 bags in a case.   

Answer #3: We will accept 200 per case, please ensure you are bidding on the correct total 
quantity. 

Question #4: Based on previous ordering history and purchase orders, about how often are the 
trash liners ordered (Monthly, quarterly or other) and what is an approximate case order? If it is 
as needed and quantities vary can you please provide the quantity of the last order placed   

Answer #4: With regards to the number of cases ordered, we currently order between 700 to 
950 cases of each liner yearly, with the current number of liners per case as previously noted. 
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Question #5: Can we call FedEx at our expense and pick up a sample of each of the liners, so we 
can see exactly what you are happy with. If yes, can you provide us with the address where 
FedEx should go, a contact name, phone number & email address, and times that FedEx can 
come. 

 
Answer #5: Will County will not provide samples of what is currently used, required 
specifications are listed in the solicitation documents. 

 
Question #6: Regarding the bid bond, you are only asking for 1 case of each on the bid, even 
though you purchase alot of cases, the bid bond will not amount to much.. 

 
Answer #6: The bid bond should be calculated by the total extended quantity listed, or the 
grand total for one year total cost. 
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Yr Qty UOM
Pack 
Size

Price/ ?? Price/ ?? Price/ ?? Price/ ??  Price/ ?? Price/ ??
#1 TOILET PAPER 17280 RL 500/96  No Bid  $             0.42  $            0.42  No Bid  $              0.37  $              0.57 

 No Bid  $      7,292.16  $     7,200.00  No Bid  $       6,393.60  $       9,849.60 

#2 MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS 9600 PK 250/16  No Bid  $             1.18  $            2.26  $          1.00  No Bid  $              1.20 
 No Bid  $    11,328.00  $   21,726.00  $   9,600.00  No Bid  $     11,520.00 

#3 FACIAL TISSUES 6000 BX 100/30  No Bid  $             0.66  $            0.80  $          0.63  $              0.69  $              0.69 
 No Bid  $      3,960.00  $     4,788.33  $   3,780.00  $       4,140.00  $       4,140.00 

#4 PAPER CUPS 5 OZ 24 CS 3000  No Bid  No Bid  $        106.17  $        68.50  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $     2,548.08  $   1,644.00  No Bid  No Bid 

#5 CAN LINERS 40” X 46” CLEAR 700 CS 100  $           20.01  $           19.64  $          24.00  $        22.31  $            17.70  $            27.13 

 $    14,004.00  $    13,748.00  $   16,800.00  $ 15,617.00  $     12,390.00  $     18,991.00 
#6 CAN LINERS 30” X 47” CLEAR 480 CS 100  $           25.24  $           24.66  $          18.48  $        23.70  No Bid  $            26.29 

 $    12,115.20  $    11,836.80  $     8,869.33  $ 11,376.00 
 No Bid  $     12,619.20 

#7 CAN LINERS 30” X 37” CLEAR 480 CS 1000  $           37.74  $           22.19  $          65.14  $        33.94  No Bid  $            29.36 

 $    18,115.20  $    10,651.20  $   31,267.20  $ 16,291.20 
 No Bid 

 $     14,092.80 
#8 CAN LINERS 24” X 33” RED 30 CS 250  $           19.84  $           39.00  $          13.05  $        22.45  No Bid  $            70.16 

 $         595.20  $      1,170.00  $        391.35 
 $      673.50  No Bid 

 $       2,104.80 
#9 CAN LINERS 40” X 46” RED 75 CS 125  $           32.34  $           78.00  $          45.72  $        26.58  No Bid  No Bid 

 $      2,425.50  $      5,850.00  $     3,428.75  $   1,993.50 
 No Bid  No Bid 

1st Year Award Total (approximate spend) 47,255.10$      $    65,836.16 60,975.20$  22,923.60$     73,317.40$     
2nd Year Award Total (approximate spend) 47,255.10$     74,394.86$     60,975.20$  23,611.31$     75,516.92$     
3rd Year Award Total (approximate spend) 47,255.10$     84,066.19$     60,975.20$  24,319.65$     77,782.43$     

0% 13% 15% 0% 3% 3%
0% 13% 15% 0% 3% 3%
0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 1%

Lead Time ARO 2 days 30-45 days 2 days 1-2 days 1-2 days 1-2 days

Optional Year two (2) Percentage Increase
Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase 

Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its 
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