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2025-29 Dietary & Nursing Supplies
Addendum #1, March 7, 2025

We received the following questions regarding this RFQ;:

Question #1: Can you please provide the previous award tabulation with winning vendors and
individual item prices?

Answer #1: Please see attached spreadsheet from 2022 award for pricing.
Question #2: Based on previous ordering history and purchase orders, about how often are the
gloves ordered (Monthly, quarterly or other) and what is an approximate box order? If it is as

needed and quantities vary can you please provide the quantity of the last order placed

Answer #2: We order as needed. The last order for gloves was on 10/18 for 13 cases of gloves,
both latex and latex free.
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Iltem Description YrQty |JUOM |Pack Size | Price/ ?? Price/ CPSL Price/ ?? Price/ CPSL
1|STYROFOAM CUPS 16 OZ 312 CS|500 $ 13,047.84| $ 41.82 No Bid
2|STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 156 CSJ]1000 $ 6,857.76| $ 43.96 No Bid
3|STYROFOAM CUPS 80Z 32 CSJ]1000 $ 1,074.88 | $ 33.59 No Bid
4{STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 80Z. 12 CSJ]1000 $ 563.88 | $ 46.99 No Bid
5[STYROFOAM SQUAT CUPS 40Z 12 CSJ]1000 $ 487.44 | $ 40.62 No Bid
6|STYROFOAM SQUAT CUP LIDS 40z 50 SL
100/10 No Bid No Bid
7|CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE 2501 CTN|4 $ 100.68| $ 0.40 No Bid
8|DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT 170 CSJ]1000 $ 2,963.10| $ 17.43 No Bid
9|CLEAR DRINKWARE 100Z 36 SL|100/6 No Bid No Bid
10|DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 80z CS
3 1000 $ 268.17 | $ 89.39 No Bid
11|DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS 10 CS
10000 $ 558.00 | $ 55.80 No Bid
12|DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 16| BALE|500 $ 407.36 | $ 25.46 No Bid
13|DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4 48[ BALE|500 $ 850.56 | $ 17.72 No Bid
14|DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG 12 BX|1000 $ 43512 | $ 36.26 $ 154.08| $ 12.84
15|DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT 10 CS|500 $ 703.80 | $ 70.38 No Bid
16|FOIL ROLL W/CUTTER BOX 15 RL
18"X1000° 1 $ 869.85 | $ 57.99 No Bid
17{FILM WRAP W/CUTTER BOX 80 BX
18"X1000° 1 No Bid No Bid
Medline Dispose N Save




Item Description YrQty JUOM |Pack Size | Price/ ?? Price/ CPSL Price/ ?? Price/ CPSL
18|BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER 240 PK
GREEN 50/12 No Bid No Bid
19|BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED 120 PK]50/12 No Bid No Bid
20{BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE 120 PK]50/12 No Bid No Bid
21|BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY 120 PK]50/12 No Bid No Bid
22(BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC 120 PK
WHITE 50/12 No Bid No Bid
23(BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE 100 BG
100/10 No Bid No Bid
24|BUN RACK COVER 52" X 80" 10| CS|50/10 $  45940.00 | $ 4,594.00 $ 208.20| § 20.82
25[DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE 1,800 PK]50/12 No Bid No Bid
26(DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN 120 PK
50/12 No Bid No Bid
27{DINNER NAPKINS YELLOW 1,200 PK]50/12 No Bid No Bid
28[DINNER NAPKINS RED 120 PK]50/12 No Bid No Bid
29[DINNER NAPKINS ECRU 600 PK]50/12 No Bid No Bid
30|DINNER NAPKINS WHITE 140 PK]100/28 No Bid No Bid
31|PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING 60 CSJ]1000 $ 3,060.00 | $ 51.00 No Bid
32|PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY 2 CS
BIRTHDAY 200ea/cs No Bid No Bid
33|PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC 3 CS|200ealcs No Bid No Bid
34|PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE 1 CS|200ealcs No Bid No Bid
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Item Description YrQty |JUOM [Pack Size | Price/ ?? Price/ CPSL Price/ ?7? Price/ CPSL
35(PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICK’S 1 CS
200ealcs No Bid No Bid
36|PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER 1 CS
200eal/cs No Bid No Bid
37|PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER’S DAY 1 CS
200ealcs No Bid No Bid
38|PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN 1 CS|200ealcs No Bid No Bid
39|PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING 1 CS
200eal/cs No Bid No Bid
40{PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR 1 CS|200ealcs No Bid No Bid
41|PLACEMAT BLUE GREEK KEY 200 CS]1000 No Bid No Bid
42(WIPES FOODSERVICE, PINK 190 CS
STRIPE 200 No Bid No Bid
43| TOWELETTE WET NAP 20 CS]1000 $ 596.40 29.82 No Bid
44|BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE, 1 6 CS
GALLON 1000 $ 321.54 53.59 No Bid
45(CAMBRO LID MUG 80Z. 9 SL|1500 $ 525.87 58.43 No Bid
46|CAMBRO LID BOWL 90Z. 25 SL|1000 $ 1,447.00 57.88 No Bid
47|VINYL GLOVES LARGE 250 BX]100/10 No Bid $ 975.00| $ 3.90
48|VINYL GLOVES MEDIUM 350 BX]100/10 No Bid $ 1,365.00| $ 3.90
49(VINYL GLOVES X-LARGE 250 BX]100/10 No Bid $ 975.00| $ 3.90
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50(DISPENSE EXPRESS NAPKINS 180 PK
WHITE 500/12 Incorrect item Incorrect item Bid | No Bid
51|PLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 502 134|CS 36 $ 10,313.98 | $ 76.97 No Bid
52|PLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 90Z 67 CS|36 $ 4,486.32 | $ 66.96 No Bid
53|PLASTIC TUMBLER CLEAR 120Z 67 CS|36 $ 5,900.02 | $ 88.06 No Bid
54|PLASTIC COFFEE MUG 96 SL
WHITE/SILVER 80Z 8/24 No Bid No Bid
55(PLASTIC DINNER PLATE 80 PK
WHITE/SILVER 9” 12/10 No Bid No Bid
56(PLASTIC PLATE WHITE/SILVER 6” 100 PK
15/10 No Bid No Bid
57(PLASTIC BOWL WHITE/SILVER 100 PK
100Z 15/10 No Bid No Bid
58(PLASTIC COFFEE MUG 96 SL
IVORY/GOLD 80Z 8/24 No Bid No Bid
59(PLASTIC DINNER PLATE 1 CS
IVORY/GOLD 9” 1000 $ 166.14 [ $ 166.14 No Bid
60(PLASTIC PLATE IVORY/GOLD 6” 2 CS]1000 $ 23542 | $ 117.71 No Bid
61(PLASTIC BOWL IVORY/GOLD 100Z 100 PK
15/10 No Bid No Bid
62(PLASTIC FORKS REFLECTIONS 2 CS
SILVER/ BLACK 7 V%" 1000 $ 2460 | % 12.30 No Bid
63[PLASTIC SPOONS REFLECTIONS 3 CS
SILVER/ BLACK 7 ¥%”
20/24 (480) | No Bid No Bid
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64(PLASTIC KNIVES REFLECTIONS 3 CS
SILVER/ BLACK 7 V%" 20/24 (480) | No Bid No Bid
65|PLASTIC FORKS REFLECTIONS 3 CS
SILVER/ WHITE 7 %" 20/24 (480) | No Bid No Bid
66(PLASTIC SPOONS REFLECTIONS 3 CS
SILVER/ WHITE 7 %"
20/24 (480) | No Bid No Bid
67|PLASTIC KNIVES REFLECTIONS 2 CS
SILVER/ WHITE 7 %" 1000 $ 2584 [ $ 12.92 No Bid
68|50Z PAPER DRINKING CUPS 1|CS 3000 $83.07| $ 83.07 No Bid
69|3 COMP FOAM DINNER PLATE 9" 10[{CS 500 $302.70( $ 30.27 No Bid
70|STYROFOAM DINNER PLATE 9" 100|CS 4/125 No Bid No Bid
71|STYROFOAM CAKE PLATE 6" 16|CS 1000 $655.36( $ 40.96 No Bid
Grand Total 1st Year $ 103,272.70 $ 4,656.18
2nd Year w/% Inc $ 103,272.70 $ 4,888.99
3rd Year w/% Inc $ 103,272.70 $ 5,133.44
Optional Year two (2) Percentage Increase 15% 0.00%
Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase 15% 0.00%
Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its entirety 0% 0.00%
lead 2 days Lead 2 days
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